Smrm amw "2;3
BOTRRC R 1Y
TOTHRTRe BHesR
(BoOTHTBT LVT=eIT)
ITRFEIB 3 HTO ,qoﬁm? (TRe3 oboZre Ty DY, ANQ)
(azz: ®) adecks 2017
(20178 QgeEzcd dueods Kos-14)

BTOFET @ 8360 xoﬂ@mf (TB3e3 0DOTed D) TY, ANL) LHICDI, 20065,
I, SHTE B[ITED WOTN WTEOPNT.

2@ [, JOOT  FOWWWE  WHEINSWN TToFWT [ 30 r)om’r{@é (TRe3
QODOTEe B DY, AND) BHIODT, 2006& (2006 6@5—‘@36 @aaomm 8) ™I,
KlarEde mm@m omsmﬁcb@dbod

P PoTT MeTIRT WOTIoLHe THFBY FIFLT T, QPOSROBOOOT
BROOTOZ WHACHNZTNG, F0TT:i—

I ZogW IATL HB) TP~ (1) B3 VOIODIBJI, FIorws [ 3o xo%mﬁ
(TRez Qodogee T DY, AINO) (EWTR)  WQICHT, VHICPT, 2017 DO
ESIOWET ave

(2) 1 B 5 Je JBScensd 81 BRBSe 22ON WTIFER DB YVIT YVTLIOTED
Tow, ATFTRY ATFO cmséwgdg VOTHBICL  FRVT RRBIRRWIRT  LOF
OT0BHOT OR WTBIT),

2. 28 HFOrOT SHWR.- ITIored B dTd NOFNY (Tded 0RO I Y,
RRD) ©HACHI, 20063 (20068 FTorwE ©LHICDT 8) (AQ ARTVT  Fww
BRVOPIDIJOD WGeHITTNT) 28e T[ITTY,~

(2) (PFF) DORT ITHOD, B3 VROOT TTOBIRT, FeOXIFRY, QOTTB:—-
“To0, SHRYTIC BRCAFNR P03 XTFT WBmO BTV mi@pdw ROTIO, TR
asaegosmd SERT TOTHFTY ©0w B BRCITD, 6@;}3@63@ Slelaibuiely: CWJ)
QPFORRT 0T BT, TORINITL,”
(@) (%) DorTY,-
(i) “oxoRIBeIT wFme BOROLRE LoRN YRTHITIVE [ ST RoZne
~0ww§om IBRT” 20w wdrie;o‘n DERVTIZW); m@b

(i) R Klavkye) TRBORT (238) DoBT IHTOD 8 moéﬁd&ol ﬁ@@ﬁéﬁéc%,
DOTIT:—



2

“TO0B, GPUZ XTFT wH@me BT0 DI ©OFH DENNE TRe3
TOLEOD, FBRT FOTHFTY JODWTWTVTT WOF DEJ0W DT WOT
NFTTY FeofF B TRIIONT O, IVBIITI.”

(R) (2F°) DOBT BRJONY "I AW R0SOD WRVT BJINW DB PTIT
TONTREIT TONOTI VIO, LENRANIT” 20w TENAFIY, XeOTITW),

(B) (3R) DVOBTY “20W LINTAVODE, FORERITIT” HOW TJWRYR 20T
éb%&)mé@o:o%& ROO3RCWITT Tone ToXT T0RN DINTHOODNYRY, weieoR0S” 20w
TN, TS RBRIZT),

(@) (%) 930553& 83 TVODTTI, g\%oﬁmﬁxa‘ﬁ&d%, QOTIT:—

(%) "WeRdY  ADNRW" HOTWT, ATEFO  TSeINTY, WINTOIOCDNY 3T
RORONTY, AN ODTIT WP, LWRVIIQE  FE  d¥r0  FOZNYY,  w0eAN
DJNTONONTY, T, IFFTY BHTBRBTWIVTOTOZ VT NRWZ RN, NIRRT
WOBINAH  H QBT LOWYT INFNOR XedT BINOTRN  OFoo  IIDF LT
ébméz‘;:)rﬁ@mﬁ &aezﬁ@% RCERNS;”

3. 38 TECHT STWWIB.— TDRY BHICHTT 3¢ JFTenY,~

(R) (B¢ TTBIE JVOBITY “F§ 880 xo:o;ﬁe;o” Q0W TJTNY SHTOD
"I, BERY, DINTOODAKN” 20w JIBRAYRY, DB "HE 330 xo:q;ﬁe;” Q0 TITNEG
ST0TOOD "B QORI @%&méeo:bﬁe:” DOW TBNTTY, k’e@:ﬁa’@d%.

() (2)Fe TTBTRTY,-

(i) “Zwro acpnen” Q0w TJOAIR ‘Y VAR 200 TR
BBoIRCBRIZT); I,

(i) (2)Be WTTIOT IHTOD B3 TWHOLT  WOOBIRIT, KOTITRY,
NOTT:—-

“T003), P08 XTorl WTwmo W0 OSRFYTIE DE0ID  CIPP)Te [ ETT
BReRFNY  BOWORWY AW, TReZ T|OIOD IFATY, ©R BRI, TP
ToegaDdY WP HFRD TAET ©OINY GoTE RS TP XToFD ACPNYTON &0
SPIN ODTIBIYT =G STeo zjom;ﬁe; RPN T, BT, DJNTOODNEY
BBTT  BRERFNRTN To%, RFOFTR WHINUIVTTT ©OF DO FeoDF B
RO O, IBTTIW,”

(%) (6)3¢ TTFTRTY,—
()  “Z5rd” 90w TEE, WRVEITX; DT,
(i) (6)Se TTFTT ITOH &5 TWOOT  TWIOBIRD, HeOIIZR),
QDOTT:—
“TOOB, T FFFU WHEe B0 CPRTE DEICI  odpFPTe  BReRFROR
TOTTPT, T3 TOCEOLT, IWAWY, ©nt Ovs, FO[IT, T3 [OFY KNSOID TOTIVT,



3

TSe3 TOODT, IVBRI WNZIVPYOY, ©TO  ITFO VTPW0 TOAN VDTOITIYS
DB, BeIF, VFATROOD  FOFNY 2R FITT BRI THeIBI,  QeRDZTT)N
3eoF 3 ERNeny CRVERNIOWIAVATs-iapiaJiiCTele DEJOH DROT P WOF  LRITY
SBIIZ,”

4. 43¢ TFOW J3ABREWR.~ VRO VRICHIT 43¢ ISeg T8 TVODITI,
B303ReRITZT, OTT:~

“4. ODIRIIIYT F@ dFr0 ToINYY Teled Jges.— KPP WIONTRTY & 3TT
HTTT VDT YOT0IRI BFW YYTOIRIBLT LDRITIQYT g ¥ JoFNIQ
QTP ROPNYR Doz, ToTPT, TP TOTY RS0 IFWE  ApBIWT, Teded TOeFoD
BT TFeTBW, VCTIZT:

VOO, PO FFFS VPTo VBT DI 0IPRTe R,33T BN SDENNCI
Taded TOeFoDhR), SBAT FOBPFTY, 8N WoP FReRFNT TJpdessyn  FeohEE Do
T, AONRIWTTRT WOT DRIOH TROT D) WOF LOITY Szﬁﬁa‘ﬁp%”

5. 40 TFOHRTW SWIR.— VPG BHICNTT 42 TFORT (1)Ze WBTFTRTY,~
(i) (B) LoBTY,-

() (ihSe WTLOBTY, “Bezme ©THTZ08” w00 IWNRYR “Feswo 0 ;T03”
200 TERIR, BIOIREBTIZT; I

(@) (iihSe wBDORTY, “Sesmo wTZZOB” w0w ITNRSK “Beswo AT ;T308”
0w ajcsneéab% @éo&mﬁﬁé%ﬁ%

(i) TT0BT SWTOH 85 VNOOT TVTOWIIT, BCOTTET), LOTT:~

"B TTOBD, FPTUT ATFT WFHHe VBT DEJOID SWRTe [BTS &Teo FoekF N
TOTPTY, T3 TOFoDT), IBAW RoWPHFTIY, AeLdNY BOWEN FeoLF T TNV,
QONTUTTT WOT DI SERIFT:

VYT TOOBD, JeFwo WRTFEOZ  FREDODYTH xo:jpmf RELDNYT, TTOFEITT
WTRHFTY ROT DOWIFT) B FToF LT DO TOBTR xo&%odaeg @2,325@6@(3&@2

WOF ACINYTY, ABTT RT ebowzs&d%.” -

6. 4 TFTOTW STIB.— TP VHICNIT 48 TITLRTY,-

(R) (2)Be YOTTFTOT ITITOOD 85 NONT TIONFID, XeOFIIW), DOTT:—

“TooR, YBe WS 8o BRCRWFNSMON TS RFTFT WPWe WTT $2EOIN
mmsé T3 waegodaab% SEAT ROTHFTY, wWos B8 &8 BRERFNPMON, BT,
WTRTRLODNH & TOeFoDY NYAT TRONNRY Ded THFeIBIW, AFIFZR), STE WOF
BT, DFRTROOD TOFNT TieITN ACLNTNIHRT VOF HEJOD R DI, ¥o3
LEBTY Feoned B TPV B, IBRIFT,”

() (3)3e YOTTFTEOT STOWOOD, B3 WNOOT TTOBIVT, XeOTIZTR, DOWT:—



4

") TTOB, LT FFFT WP W D0 TS $3e0T o3oR)TIe mmsé
BRe3 ToeFo, IWAor, AewdNY ToWdMRN FeoleEE TAOON W, To[PTY, TN
ToegoDY ITWT 0L’ BT0T e ORIV ITT WOF E0IW 5&53@6&. Elovi
DINTROODAY  FOFHI), TWIL BT DJDTHOODNH  APOTT  ROTPFTY,
RODWTWTTRT 0T DEIOH FRVF DB ¥oF APSTY FITONT o, IBTTIW).”

7. 53¢ TFOOR® STIJR.- RO LRICNIT 5S¢ JFoT (7)I¢ WWBTFTTY
“OBORBETT  TOTU[T, DT FTORFIPOTNYI, Te3  Boedosme B0
a@rcgmxssp%” ROV JTNER  “OPRORITOT MDY ATI, o) TOORDF VTIITTIY
Ooz, XFOFTRY ROVNBWITEOZ FiSed 0edp5sd WS 20NRRYIIII,” HoW
TTERYI, T3 TIZT);

8. 9%e TITEOW SWHTJR.~ RV WRICHIT 9IJe TFTTY,~

(@) (ihSe DoBTY,-

() (2) WTLOBT oS0 “B) W9T Jedrro DF|ITE), ACLVNYR, ITor 3BT
DTHHFNY TNROT DOWIFTR” D0 JHRTY, ﬂeaxssp%;

(i) Spcwde TCoBDIBY “Tond FB|PS, TReT TOCTY TS IBIT FO[IT
TR waeﬁoda” R0W JITNY SV=OD “@Bwo P03 IToFD WBwo NOTLRF 0T woN
©TT D2EYOIN IFAT TOTIF, TeSe3 TOEFOD” 20w JWFT, FeORITLY; I

(i) ooESe TCoBIBY “s00RN WRTITIYT J 8330 xoz;pﬁe; TOTR) ISBAT”

DOV TTNTTY, w%wcéésécj%.

() (i) B¢ DOBZY,-

(i) (2) WIDOBBY “s003N [ BTo ;ﬂom;ﬁe; ROPHY TBAT” 200 JBNGR,
DEVVBIZT.

(i) (@) wILoBT FeJoDY DB T BeFE  VTICI),  ACRNRTRY
BIDFWIT DWHFNY TVRVT DOWIFTZ” D0 JTBRYIY m’eams&cﬁ%;

(i) Wecode ICoDITY “Oox, T[S, TS WOeTY TNICW IWIT TOTPT,
TR waeﬁoda” NOW TTNY  STWe0D  “OTw0 08 JToFT LB
ROTIOF NTTIN WBT DHEICIW IWROW  FOTTII, T5e3 TOEFOD” 20w
BTN, BeORIFTR; D)

(iv) oo@Ese TCoBIBY “0oBN LDWABIYT [ GHTo xoz;pﬁe; TOTR IBAT”
PO TTNYI), WEDWTBIZT),

(2) (IV)Se DoRBY “BFes Hedpmsme FNICW ADFTTBTWIBWEOF” 0
BORYR “QOPBVTDWOT” 20w TWNYR, BECSRZTIII.



5

wcgcsneéo B FTNG T

Srwd §@ &30 ROFMY (Jhed Q0DOZre I Y, ANG) VHICLI, 2006,
(20060 3T0F 3T WOICHT 8) B3 JWOOTPYNETON LOTW0E FIFRED SWTE SRR
OBI[OT TONEFIOINT, HOTT:~

(R) Tow, ATFTPY ToTPT, TR TVOCTOD, IWAYT;

(V) o028 ATFO ©Pme ©B0 HWJ0W TOTWZ, TEed  TOCFODY, SBADI
ROTHFTY, @O DN TEReS  TOCFOWOT @a%(;bmeé Ty0807F  OF,
TTWOINTHT;

(R) Q[T DINTHLCNTOR ATD TOBWT, BRI TOeE ©Pw RV RFFT
Sl Clnie) m%QOSJ DROF %emﬁ@;m& B0NTYT;

(8) swmN 3363953 xoﬂ@mfo REorBTROOT TTXT LTOTE wBY &N BT
T3 TOCBODT), WOT wTOWHE WITOTON SHEAYT;

() OO, RNFFTRY T  WHT 3T, QEJOD  eoT  IEWS  Feoled 3

FPQIONTTION JODTNFR, CPWAWTITT WOF 0e30DY T3

(2F°) “FE oo xoﬂ@” DO TOLPRODY RN DJLTLODNTI), XeORT)T;

(B) 93T TWRONT STRTRINET, TR [RBSONT.

BSINTOOT 83 WTEONT



SRS z;mawaﬁ T,

TFONT TXTOZT Tpvey OSRRYTE BT HWII, WHRROBD[OL.
) e bA) pA) L &

-0



TICIRCES TORY TR BO3 HIT Y

oW 2

REORLD NTEITCONTT 235¢ TFOeeB (V) DOTWH TTOBFRY)  DEQ0DTY,
WY TORTT, TrdeB TOCFODTY, TWRF ITOTTTY, VODIED To%s, XToF TF
BHTOTB/I, eSS,

QoT’ 3

XEOREY  YUTEOICONTVT  33¢  TFOD  (6)D¢  YVDTBFTOL  TOOBVTY)
DEJONT, DB [y BeeRFNY Sy TFesneron deolegE IO
DTOTTR), VODWIELD To, IToF OF WQTTTY, W,

O 4

VBOIREBRLD T ESFRT 43¢ TpOeey  QWIONTW, B TPESNTTON
3e00eEE  FPQOON  QDTRTJY, AOVRILY Do, TFFTY  WHFTTWR,
QeTIT.

QoW 5

ReORL NTAART 4 TBOOD (1)I¢ LVTTFTOT (B) DORT TTOBE
2EEONY TOWFMN FeoQEE TRV SRWT HeLdNY TOWEMON DBIODZ,
QODWFL T "fJED&-'CSﬁ& VOTTIR, WIS,

O 6

(i) BedoZen uBedRCRT 40 TFORT (2)Se WBIFTT JI0BTY)
DEJODT, DI, By VFAmWOH  FOZRIR  Fhesneron

DTOTT|IY, VODWILD Ty :sﬁrd@ VHOTTBZ, BT

(i)  RedRd T edRRT 420 FTITEHT (3)Ie WTTFTOT TTOBFR),~
(2) 3eoeE 3 TPRAOOMTTON AONT TOWIMON DBJODZ,;
(R) BeRT  DJITROODNE  FOTFHIW, T3TeN WD  APOTT
ROTHRFBY  QAJODTY, DT BeIY, DJDmooHNE  PIJon®
DTOTHR,,

R MO S IAVE V) ooz :3@9'6@ @@@dd&a Z-Decsagd.

QLor’ 7

53¢ TBOT (7)Je QOTITT0R) TREBNIMON ODROTECTT  MOOREIND
BB @oﬁa;&maﬁ@éma AORTNE  TVROT  AODNTED ooz, ﬁ@?d%
©RTTBI, DEDTT.

O 8

TEOSRERTLY T EATTRT 9Ne TFOHRT (iv)Se DOBFY) Jeoles 3 RO
O, SEWT DTOTVI, JODNTLD Tozy, XFFTE WHTTII, WL,

TARDZ TOIT CBTOTTT TFYRERIORD woBIH FOHTTNG.

-

2[00 TOONTH
NTZ 870 TWOSNED

O, RS
FOORFTEF (T)
BIOFEIB VoS XY




OO

IR EIT o) &F o so:;ne: (J3e3 000 DIy DO, ANQ) LRICHIH, 20063 (20065
ITOFEIT VRACHL 8) w% 2 Pon

XXX XXX XXX
2. TOIneh.- Xxx XXX XXX

(2F)" mRTBPT, TESe3 T[OeTY FIT WPTD FWS" HOTWT, ADENEIA TReT
TOLFOD), TWROI, 3¢ TFOLOW LRODY TWI[OT Tow, FFOFTH DT,

XXX XXX XXX
(88) ":soi@ojo REEDNW" D0TT, VOROLDICST TP VOROLDZ TN
ODTRZBYE TG Feo xoﬁ@mﬂ [OFTIVON  IBRS OB, T=e3 Boegod
WROT  DOIN BWVTOTIYT Fg égsa 730:%71% P0WT/, TFFO AT,
BRTDIBATI, JCLRND.

| Xxx XXX XXX
(DF) "®ATOI-LOTIORN" HOTT, TCODH TPOT 30T @WEHTO TN RIAT
DB, [e3W  TRTA  ARDEWT DB ARPT  OTFTD  TOFONY  §PTIT IR
SEROEERI 2., SDCT%@F;

Xxx XXX XXX
(Br) "Ng 33w :30%" POTT, I sa:d&uc;p QTVONTY WVIPCRAT T
maéé QERT  BBOOD, BTRETIBITY, W CoBe TROVOT  FBORTITRR 20T
TREd  TITR), JREODLY UTFIIPREAETOF T8 ST, WIWH WFwo F§
$3c0 TRAONTDNYT, SEWIWT T 10T DJNTAVONE, FORRLBITT  AIWR)T
é:ddsaol% O TS BP0 TS BTEO 2WOT :doﬁ@;

Xxx XXX XXX
() WeRDEy  RCLDNWD"  D0TT, WO FSeINYY, WINTHAOODNY  FF3T
RdeDRYY, AN OMWTIT D, OMTISTYE JE 230 FOFNYY, ©OWIRURI
20NN, BWDIRWT LOBHJND DB QT 2OWET JINFNAYR 20T JInemn Nexde
2CLVNLD;

XxXx XXX XXX
3. oo TR, TEed Toewy, B~ (1) = BOOOTT[OIRFRROR 2.0TD Tz,
TOWIT, TS TOCFY WW QTIZ;

By @

XXX 00 XXX @ XXX



9

TO0B), R YDWINIBRT  HORN 38 3 :Joﬂ@rie;o, QTR POTEEOD
QTRHFNPMON  WeXIEy AC.DNY BROToN, IR, OQ ACVRY, Tk, WIS, BRI
TOTY  TWIT  TROT P& TRRTED &)e&é@ocsé DB 603% ToRIRoBT, ©n Toz,
REOFTRY WHRABIOD DRVT, PFTHe0D, TOIFT,, ACBICROON I 1T TWIINYY
5Teo DETEWT  STOIN ODTITILT T dFre ROFNY GTWIT WNET TGN,
LYRROTOZ, T RPFIOW LPURMBTI, TOBOH ITHT QE Tom; TO[RT, TReD
TOCTY W SONTY, TOTT TURWIID.

(2) BRS8N, B3 3o xo%ﬁeég RFOFO RN LTHFNG TSeITYN ADENEIA
BReP  TOBoH, IWFIIW), WO AWridION  STHBOZ  IRCRILNPTRN  Tow
REOFT:Y, BNSITONUTDTTR), TOBOD WRTONTDY, FY VIO, RS, TRe3
waeag 1@'@35% &adﬂ"n’jgiid%.

Xxx = 00 XXX @ XXX

(6) TBEROTH ITFO AW TPeIWR, T ARRIRT, TReI TOFY XS0V
STAT  TRPY, TReI TOeodY TREW D0 Spetn Hed mone ¢ ITTODT

BeoQeod TRIONT TROT Do TS AeSRRTTLY BRBWIFT,

XxXx XXX XXX

4. ORBTNBIYT FHd oF0 FoARYY TJEed QeR.- cIwFPde 0w wRIoN
DRODTY B3 FEOTIY, ACWIWT YOOI WP BYI0IRIIT Y YWTITIYT
I8 880 ROFNY TOFLHOID Mok, TxHed TOeFodh Mewsde TPeTwa, JeTIFT;
TOOD, IFFO ALINYD), BHTDIRRIT  ACDNTMON, TO[PTY, T[T TOCTOH BT
TRCBTD, @ecéo@d% QU RO O3B ORTITIYT B[S dFe0 :o‘oﬂ@ OFO BT,
DINTEONTY), TOWIFY, TReT TOeF HNIoD BeIR AT B YTBEICD ITNTY TFY
QOO Dwed JPeITIY, VWS I, SORODTY, ERTW BLRCWITD.

Xxx XXX XXX

40, TR TRTR/ODT LJOTT BOTPERY JRed AF.- (1) B WHIITY D¢
YHEOR, To%, ITFT B BOTORI WFPI YOI0IWICIT ODTITIE I8 o
RORMED, FTO oDRITIPT F@ T TOFNPY ©OT AN Toworug, Ak
50236 I Y, ANDOH BOD :d:neaea;)@ojo 563% T30 ?Mwwodéé 2T, T, AFOFT
WP VOROLTI W @g:doamséead CONADINEIM SR (30 xoz’émfo 2o
TOTPFTY, WO JIRFTY, ooz, NGFT B SToIN 5@9 égsa xo:%mﬁ [ROF
wRdRWOE  FoLZeD AR I3[, 8 S¥e MOANYYI FFFd Acdnen
TRe3TN oD POB AFoF Ty QONNTWTTTOF QODIVNST 0F) 37128 ©F0e ¢T3
VRONYT NCTTDSODT), LYRHOBOZ ToRT WEFRE FoORFREST WFOTN FTFO
REDNPOT, AW, TRET TOCTY TWSOD ROT [RRIFLR, YOIT ACRNTI), TOIN
weg é;isa xo:;pne; TOTIT B0 TocNF T TN IO @gxoméa xoféﬁeé TOTFLIROIN,
SEWE  WTPTY, T[PS TOCFOH  TRVF,  LORWIWTWITOF  AOIVNRIR  wITD



10

RARTOWTRONT  WTOWY,  OPTOTWON TOH  AWTW,  TWOTIFFTRT DB
3RRERPNT OedoDhY FeoRFZ FIOON TR VTFION BHIST PeY, DOWIITW),
z)’mgaap@ojow 353;3’3 Clap! aquozs'éﬁ LIT, OO, ATFTR), OOHRRBICHN LT, B
3R QOFFTRAT 0030NQY, T, [T, TFeP TOeE TN T 09AN WVWOIBHYT
§8 9T ROFNY ToPUHCD TwoT BoLeTT  Ackd JIWUT, B, TFUIIZI;
DOTT:—

XxXx 0 XXX @ XXX

(B) oNTITIYE wOR0sRIE IFdE IOINGY WIFIRIT P 3e00/m03

BTBe00T THCTOTTINWT WY, RDNE Tys, L-3VTSF, TOv-FRFYT W) FIF

—

WORON IRODNE e, TION VTORNY VLD BPOT, TS WRF FP,—

(i) Sezmo VT30 IRWCNYTI, ACLNNYTY, Tox, FO[IT, TReT TOeF WSO
SET BT, TFe3 TOeFoD WRVT B0WIITY,

(ii) Se3me ©WONTHOZ TPLTT), ACLWINIR), YOROLMI YDWITBYT [ e
RORNY ROTLZOID IFT FomPT, TP TOCFOH WTFID TeIoH TROT B0WIFTR;

®
D

-0

g

(iil) Besmo VTSIOZ JURTBID, ACLRNTRY, WIToR PTICONT/ BRI O
et VRHFNY DROT DOWITT,

XXX XXX XXX
4. Rez’, AFRTOH xo%rie;g T3 AWB- (1) XX XX XX

(2) QIITEOD  WRTT SO3RINT  SRAFRABNTT, VBOROWT  BeTT,
WINTROODT  YOIOLR3 OBD0  WOTLOF 0ToT@oN @gxomséeSU xo;);mfo, sme
FOZOD €07 FOZOH ACLRNIRY, FTPY, JFed Toeod Hewd DI ToFTuHowD
SEDS  HOTPT, Ted3 TOEOD [RVT Tone T, ITFOR) BHRRLWIWTTOTOZ

&owé%po.
Q

(3) Qe DINTVOOD xo;);mvb WINTHOOD BT SOIRNT  DAONTNT),
PPIORST ©T3 T, ITFOTROOR ANTORTIONT  WT0TE  wyFRoBTY, ©oF
FINFIRTRONT LTOTTY LTWIOTRTE, LT BOFT FOFNE QT ©0F 0033
) &m@rmmd@o@ﬁ ©WOF NYW TTTY T RFFTRY SERT  TOTIT, BT
TOETY  BWIOD THLT NOWETT TBL DB TBIREIT FTBe0D wHFON FTWTY
DTBOLRY  TEEeTUTTIOT D), AeeONY JeI® TE [0S IRBOSPNTIIRR 0B
ROWOTITEY ;jo;);mfo WTEIODT), YDIOWS TRVT VATV ZPTICODTL /L3R 0L

3R6R00T  BOWLETIT AN  TFeTOTTOIIWT i), AeLdNY  Jedmwo AT TYOT



11

TPOIIDY. 09T JeTm VBB, ReTF, DJDTREOD FOFNW SBRT TSed  TOeFoD
TROT (TR NBODIWHOZ) B0e0L3eTT xoi@oda LeLDNTONTIZT),

Xxx XXX XXX
5. T3ed edpmsme Bwd.- (1) Xxx XXX XXX

@) @gxomséeéd VFTO TOTLRF DIOTTN YOTOLRE INTITIYT 503N
%8 dFre ROFNY BOTR) FoPY J¥ed TOeFoNT), IEID WRHFORLeTT MHeILTEY,
B FODFOTOINGRY, TFSed edpssme BN0W ADFTTRBITT), Tone T[T,
T3eS adt)ego:b @@Gﬁ% O] ﬁoe@z&w%o&aﬁa& TRBITT, @gxomséeéd T
BOTWLTOF Z[oToN e.—ogxomés ODTIIIQT RN T3 3e0 xoi@mﬂ ROTY) FeoLLod
RO B BIBAGRY, [PRTON  WTZ),  IPOHINIToN, TRTTBIFTION  H)
BReRBoIPNTOE  0e30DY  IBWTOZ  IReRENWNT  NFeBOOT  TReT ez
RSN WPYNY WOBE D) DDeOPORODNTR, SRWIIL), VW AN SHTOS
SREBEAWT TeOTON Tot REHFSR) Taded Hedpmdmm FWSR WBBLT[IY, BoBONY
VOTONIR, B IPFCDNYI, LBNIITI,

Xxx XXX XXX
9. aeedne mowd w3y weRTed.— T[T NOFNGY 2.43) TPORATIT ARNYY,
XXX XXX XXX

(i) () ONTITIYD PYROTVITYT zﬂo%omg OOz, XTOFTR) WHIAWITOZ
3e.50 DJITT, AEDNTR), TozsT WTRAUT ANW, VDRAWE WITBHIRWL B 93T
HOTPT [RFNYN TOLOTTES QTHERTON meﬁ@@ﬁé@d%; B

(W) OB REDND DT, @mv@ ﬂebd@ﬁ%ﬁdé@d&. AW, TINET
20N 3366 Sesmo &aédwd@ ROLDNYY, WAL PTICOD  BRDT,  WOWOTITE
Waplalyiela wérmamgwaamﬁd:

TWOOD, ITWHFAD  BRCODT  FCLRTOTDN, PVTITIYE  VOHOT/ITYT
ROFANYY wDRAWUT PENH, YWIRWT WTTNW DB, 930 LOWIT  IRFAY
VRHENOTON WEFOOTTOT  ACEVNTD  HEFOLINTE OTY WP WO  TJINFT
é’bm@rrﬁ% 3:% ALINY esoS% SHREROT TOIT w%meﬁ%cg, &3 %emrﬁeprﬁmuﬁd
TORPT, TS TOeTY RSO IHAT ABIT, T3 TOCFOD WIBFIvTHWOT wTe
TINEE, X0 QTRHFNT, HEF SPRERYIZE: B

TOOR, SWIOTTeR ACLRNTD PSFOSPNTE WOTY, LOT LVPT %ewﬁvma, 0oRN
ODTIIIYT [3d3r0 FOFNY ROFP SET FOBRF, TNeT TOeFoD ToRoF HoEF
E3T00T &0ees TOTI, g;mrg $e0T ébméz;ﬁrﬁ@ow AT m@a@%@cﬁ%

Xxx 2 XXX = XXX



12

(i) (2) VRTHIIIYZ WORORI 8B xoz);mfeg, Jesmo WTR[TTE, BRWD
VYT AT, TN [BL 3o NOINY TOPY IFRT TTF, THe3 TOeFoH 0
TeIoDY TOTT wTFSOD S POT Ded, & xoz);ojw OIPT VOROIDZ TWNTWODE,

Hedrsodsee ¢ masécﬁw%iﬁs VORI xmmoﬁa@é %0 aplalypidela
PSFSPRERYIIT; T

(W) LOIT LMD T, o;;am-@ ReOTHNTONTOZN. TS, TINFT ACLDNY
ﬁda Sest BOZTO S[BR @RATR TECONT ﬁmem@é %e0T DTHENIR,
mrm@a@gu@m:

TTOD), YRTATIRT FOZNTY ©YROLRI JJNETN eI odycde A eeddnisd
PErodnde WY  ©FEe REEDNTTY, e:sofoé ToRBPOB T[0T QTHF T
REVTRTY, PN TConAR[ITY, TeZ  TOeFY RSO ITAT  AWIPT, Tes
aﬁ@eioﬁo W0 TeIEWOT he TINFT B ROATDZ LIRHE NI, a@rm@mgsgw%:

W) TTOB, WIPT TOITFP WOH  ACLRNRW PIroJRnte WIBY LPNTN,
S00AN WTVBIQT [ B0 :domémi TOTR) BT TOTIT, TRe3 TOLE e
00 3300 @oedd ROWIOT, @gwnr@ Xe0T Naplatytele w@rm@m%:ss&c%

Xxx 00 xXxxx @ XXX

(IV) &0 20030 &m@?ﬁ@od PEFOIPNTNTOTIT  ACLRNTTY, L) SVETLR
OFW WIWY, TRNET ActONER FeOTOI, LHoIN OWDTIIBLT 3T FOFNIYS
RUY ACDNTR BFEIBW,, TFeZ DeOpTHD FWSON ADFFIBIWTTTOF 00800
SEICOTOT T[T, W3 TOLFOD ITowwod FeoLeod TRDOT LTS WPI0X 0w
SH0T e eBIZT),

Xxx = 00 XXX @ XXX

nFFO TWEHOCD, LT TP TE, donded, &7, Ee , 1168-TERW 1000, 228 [wEFEF, 2017



N

5N S 75 ]
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
THIRTEENTH SESSION
(Adjourned Meetings)

THE KARNATAKA PROFESSIONAL EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTIONS
(REGULATION OF ADMISSION AND DETERMINATION OF FEE)

(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2017
(L.A. Bill No. 14 of 2017)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Professional Educational
Institutions (Regulation of Admission and Determination of Fee) Act, 2006.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Professional
Educational Institutions (Regulation of Admission and Determination of Fee)
Act, 2006 (Karnataka Act 8 of 2006) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty-eighth
year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Professional Educational Institutions (Regulation of Admission
and Determination of Fee) (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) Section 1 and 5 shall come into force at once and remaining
provisions shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification, in the official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Professional
Educational Institutions (Regulation of Admission and Determination of Fee)
Act, 2006 (Karnataka Act 8 of 2006) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act), in section 2,-

(a) after clause (f), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided that, in case Government of India or its agency
conducts Common Entrance Test for any course the merit
determined in such test shall be considered for making admission
to such course."

(b) in clause (jj),-

(i) the words "conducted by association of non- minority or
minority Private unaided Professional Education Institutions”, shall
be omitted; and

(ii) after clause (jj), as so amended the following shall be inserted,
namely:-



"Provided that in case the Government of India or its agency
conducts such Common Entrance Test then Centralized Counseling
shall be conducted by such agency and in such manner as may be
prescribed."

(c) in clause (n),the words “and includes persons of Indian origin and
overseas citizen of India”, shall be inserted at the end.

(d) in clause (q), for the words "affiliated to an university" the words "
affiliated to an university and includes private universities of the State" shall
be substituted.

{e) for clause (s), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(s) "Reserved seats" means the seats reserved in Government colleges,
constituent colleges of Universities, private aided and unaided professional
educational institutions, private universities in favour of persons belonging
to the Scheduled Castes, the Scheduled Tribes and Other Backward Classes
or Karnataka Students as may be notified by the State Government;"

3. Amendment of section 3.- In section 3 of the principal Act,-

(@) in sub-section (1), in the proviso, after the words "Private Unaided
Professional Educational Institutions", occurring in two places the words
"and Deemed University Institutions" shall be inserted;

(b) in sub-section(2),-

(i) for the words "Government Seats", the words "all seats" shall be
substituted; and

(ii) after sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

"Provided that in respect of any Professional Courses
where Government of India or any of its agency conducts
Common Entrance Test then Centralized Counseling shall be
conducted by such agency as may be notified by the State
Government for admission to all Government seats or seats in
private unaided Professional Educational Institutions and for
Professional Courses in deemed University on the basis of merit
secured by the candidates in the Common Entrance Test."

(c) in sub-section(6),-
(i) the word "Government" shall be omitted; and

(i) after sub-section(6), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely.-

"Provided that where Government of India or any of its
agency conducts Common Entrance Test to any Course then the
State Common Entrance Test Committee need not conduct
Common Entrance Test but Centralized Counseling for all
admission to Professional Courses in Government or Private
unaided and deemed University Institutions shall be conducted
by such agency and in such manner as may be prescribed.”



4. Substitution of section 4.- For section 4 of the principal Act, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"4, Method of Admission in Unaided Professional
Educational Institutions.- All seats in wunaided professional
educational institutions whether minority or non-minority imparting
professional education in any discipline shall make admission through
Common Entrance Test conducted by the State Common Entrance
Test Committee:

Provided that in case Government of India or its agency
conducts Common Entrance Test for any Professional Course then for
such Courses, Centralized Counseling for admission shall be
conducted by such agency and in such manner as may be prescribed.”

5. Amendment of section 4A.- In section 4A of the Principal Act, in
sub-section (1),-

(i} in clause (D),-

(a) in sub-clause (ii) for the words "sixty percent" the words "fifty five
percent” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-clause (iii) for the words "twenty percent" the words "twenty
five percent" shall be substituted.

(ii) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided further that, in case the Government of India or its agency
conducts common entrance test to any course of professional education the
centralised counselling for allotment of seats shall be conducted by such
agency as may be prescribed.

Provided also that, not less than thirty percent of the institutional
seats shall be filled by Karnataka Students and if sufficient number of
Karnataka students are not available such seats may be filled by others.”

6. Amendment of sections 4B.- In section 4B of the principal Act,-

(a) after sub-section (2} the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

"Provided that, in case Government of India or its agency conducts
Common Entrance Test for any of the Professional Educational
Courses then for such Professional Educational Courses, the Deemed
Universities shall make admission on the ranking secured in that Test
but the Centralized Counselling shall be conducted by such agency
and in such manner as may be prescribed for admission in such
Deemed University Institutions."

(b) after sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

"Provided further that, in case the Government of India or its
agency conducts common entrance test to any course of professional
education the centralised counselling for allotment of seats shall be
conducted by such agency as may be prescribed on the basis of merit



drawn from common entrance test. In case deemed universities fail to
constitute association of deemed Universities counselling shall be done
by such agency and in such manner as may be prescribed."

7. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the principal Act,
in sub-section (7), for the words "shall specify the standard and procedure"
the words "shall enforce the standards and procedures as may be prescribed
by State Government" shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 9.- In section 9 of the Principal Act,-
(a) in clause (ii),-

(i) in sub-clause (b), after the words "belonging to the Non -
Resident Indian Quota" the words "and fifty percent of the
remaining seats shall be filled by the Karnataka students”
shall be inserted;

(ii) in the first proviso for the words "State Common Entrance
Test Committee" the words "State Common Entrance Test
Committee or Common Entrance Test conducted by the
Government of India or its agency as the case may be"
shall be substituted; and

(11i) in the second proviso the words “"conducted by
Association of unaided Private Professional Educational
Institutions” shall be omitted.

(b) in clause (iii),-

(1) In sub-clause (a), the words "of the association of Private
Professional educational institutions" shall be omitted.

(ii) in sub-clause (b), after the words "belonging to the Non —
Resident Indian Quota" the words "and fifty percent of the
remaining seats shall be filled by the Karnataka students”
shall be inserted;

(i)  in first proviso, the words "or the Government of India or
its agency as the case may be" shall be inserted at the
end; and

(iv) in the second proviso, the words "conducted by the
association of Unaided Private Professional Educational
Institutions" shall be omitted.

(c) in clause (iv), for the words "specified by admission Overseeing
Committee”, the words "as may be prescribed" shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Professional
Education (Regulation of Admissions, Determination of fee) Act, 2006,

(Karnataka Act 8 of 2006) to provide for,-

(@) conduct of Common Entrance Test by the State Government;

(b) in case the Government of India or its agency conducts Common
Entrance Test, ranking of the candidates shall be obtained from such
Common Entrance Test;

(c) fill up of seats through Common Entrance Test Committee or
Government of India or its agency in deemed Universities also;

(d) if Private Educational Institutions agrees to consensual agreement
with the Government then, the conduct of Common Entrance Test
shall be in accordance with such agreement;

(e) framing of rules by the State Government for conduct centralised
counseling by it or by such agency, in such manner as may be
prescribed;

() inclusion of private universities in the definition of “Professional
Educational Institutions”; and

(g) other consequential amendments also.

Hence the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative

measure.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 2:

Proviso to clause (jj) of section 2 proposed to be inserted
empowers the State Government to prescribe the agency
and the manner of conducting Common Entrance Test.

Clause 3:

Proviso to sub-section (6) of section 3 proposed to be
inserted empowers the State Government to prescribe the
agency and the manner of Centralized Counseling for all
admission to professional course.

Clause 4:

Section 4 proposed to be substituted empowers the State
Government to prescribe the agency and the manner of
Centralized Counseling for admission.

Clause 5:

Proviso of clause (D) of sub-section (1) of Section 4A
proposed to be inserted empowers the State Government to
prescribe the agency for allotment of seats by Centralized
Counseling for allotment of seats.

Clause 6:

(1) Proviso to sub-section (2) of section 4B proposed to
be inserted empowers the State Government to
prescribe the agency and the manner for admission
to Deemed University Institutions.

(ii) Proviso to sub-section (3) of section 4B proposed to
be inserted empowers the State Government to
prescribe,-

(a) the agency for allotment of seats for Centralized
Counseling;

(b) the agency and the manner of counseling in
case deemed universities incase it fails to
constitute association of deemed universities.

Clause 7:

Sub-section (7) of section 5 empowers the State Government
to prescribe by rules the standards and procedures to be
followed for admissions.

Clause 8:

Clause (iv) of section 9 proposed to be substituted empowers
the State Government to prescribe the manner of
conducting Centralized Counseling.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character.

BASAVARAJ RAYAREDDI
Minister for Higher Education

S. Murthy
Secretary (1/C)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA PROFESSIONAL EDUCATIONAL
INSTITUTIONS (REGULATION OF ADMISSION AND DETERMINATION OF
FEE) ACT, 2006 (KARNATAKA ACT 8 OF 2006)

XX XX XX
2. Definitions.- (1) In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-
XX XX XX

(f) "Common Entrance Test Cell or Committee" means the agency of
the State Government constituted under section 3 which conducts the
Common Entrance Test.

XX XX XX
(1j) "Institutional seats" means the seats other than Government seats
filled by Private unaided Professional Educational Institutions through

common entrance test conducted by association of non-minority or minority
Private unaided Professional Educational Institutions.

XX XX XX

(n) "Non-resident Indian" means a candidate born to a parent of
Indian origin and residing outside the country and who has passed the
qualifying equivalent examination outside India;

XX XX XX

(@) "Professional Educational Institution” means college or school or an
institute by whatever name called imparting professional education or
conducting professional educational courses leading to the award of a
degree, diploma or a certificate by whatever name called, approved or
recognized by the competent statutory body and affiliated to an university;

XX XX XX

(s) "Reserved seats" means the seats reserved in Government colleges,
constituent colleges of universities, private aided and unaided professional
educational institutions in favour of persons belonging to the Scheduled
Castes, the Scheduled Tribes and Other Backward Classes as may be
notified by the State Government;

XX XX XX

3. State Common Entrance Test Committee.- (1) There shall be a
State Common Entrance Test Committee consisting of,-

XX XX XX



Provided that, in case all private unaided Professional Educational
Institutions agree and opt to fill all of their seats except the seats reserved
for non-resident Indian students through State Common Entrance Test Cell,
then the State Government may, by notification, re-constitute the State
Common Entrance Test Committee consisting of such number of members,
as it deems fit, including representatives from the management of private
unaided Professional Educational institutions imparting education in
Medical, Dental, Engineering and other faculties.

(2) The Committee shall conduct a Common Entrance Test for
admission of students to the Government seats in professional educational
institutions. For the purpose of ensuring this the State Government shall
provide such number of officers and officials to the State Common Entrance
Test Committee as may be required.

XX XX XX

(6) Admission to every Government seat shall be made on the basis of
merit secured in the Common Entrance Test conducted by the State
Common Entrance Test Committee followed by centralised counseling
subject to the reservation policy of the State.

4. Method of Admission in unaided professional educational
institutions.- Association of all unaided professional educational
institutions whether minority or non-minority imparting professional
education in any one discipline shall make admission through Common
Entrance Test: Provided that any unaided professional educational
institution or deemed university institutions, which would like to make
admission for seats other than Government seats through Common
Entrance Test Committee, may also exercise their option to join and to make
admission through Common Entrance Test Committee in the order of merit
and through counseling.

4A. Method of admission in case of consensual agreement.- (1)
Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, in case if the State
Government and the association of unaided professional educational
institutions whether minority or non-minority agree to enter into a
consensual arrangement or agreement with regard to sharing of seats and
fixation of fee in respect of such seats in said unaided professional
educational institutions, in such year, the admission to such number of
seats as agreed upon by the State Government and the private professional
educational institutions, shall be done by the common entrance test
committee as Government seats in accordance with such rules as may be
prescribed by the Government regarding selection of candidates for
admission to Government seats in Professional Educational institutions and
reservation policy of the State including reservation under Article 371J. The
remaining seats shall be filled through the Common Entrance Test
conducted by the association of private professional educational institutions



10

or association of religious and linguistic minority institutions on the basis of
merit followed by centralised counselling, in a fair, transparent and non-
exploitative manner as per the consensual agreement subject to such rules
as may be prescribed. Subject to the consensual arrangement or agreement
the State Government may, by notification, publish the seat matrix to be
filled by the State common entrance test committee and the association of
private unaided professional educational institutions in the manner as
specified below, namely:-

XX XX XX

(D) Out of the total intake of Post-graduate Medical/Dental seats, in
an unaided minority educational institutions, across the pre-clinical, para-
clinical and clinical disciplines which shall be by rotation of disciplines every
year:-

(i) not less than twenty percent of the seats shall be filled up
through Common Entrance Test conducted by State Common
Entrance Test Committee;

(ii) not more than sixty percent of the seats shall be filled up by the
merit list of Common Entrance Test conducted by the
Association of minority unaided Professional Educational
Institutions; and

(iii) not more than twenty percent of the seats shall be filled up by
Non-Resident Indians /Management quota candidates.

XX XX XX

4B. Method of Admission in Deemed University Institutions.- XX
XX XX

(2) The deemed university non-minority or minority Institutions, as
the case may be, which do not follow UGC guidelines shall fill up such
number of seats in their institution through Common Entrance Test
Committee and Common Entrance Test conducted by association as may be
notified by the State Government.

(3) If Deemed University Institutions follow the UGC Regulations but
agrees to consensual agreement with the State Government subject to such
consensual agreement the seat sharing formula shall be not less than 25
percent of the total intake both in Undergraduate and Post-graduate Medical
Course to be filled up through Common Entrance Test Committee conducted
by the State Government at such rate of fee with such concession and
scholarship by such Institutions as may be agreed upon in the Consensual
Agreement and not more than 25 percent of the total intake to be filled up



11

by Non-Resident Indians/Management Quota by following merit by the
institutions concerned. The remaining 50% shall be the Institutional seats to
be filled up through Entrance Examination conducted by the Deemed
University Institutions (as currently followed).

5. Admission Overseeing Committee.- XX XX XX

(7) The Admission Overseeing Committee shall specify the standards
and procedure to be followed by the Association of unaided Private
Professional Educational Institutions 1{non-minority or minority as the case
may be|l while conducting the common entrance test and shall oversee and
supervise the common entrance test. The Admission Overseeing Committee
shall also supervise and oversee the centralised counseling and the
admissions made by the Association of unaided Private Professional
Educational Institutions 1[non-minority or minority as the case may bejl in
order to ensure that it is conducted in a fair, transparent and non-
exploitative manner. For the purpose of ensuring this the State Government
shall provide such number of officers and officials to the Admission
Overseeing Committee as may be required.

XX XX XX

9. Allocation and reservation of seats.- Out of the total intake of
seats in a professional educational institution,-

XX XX XX

(ii) (a) in an unaided non-minority institution fifty percent of the seats
shall be reserved for candidates belonging to the Scheduled Castes, the
Scheduled Tribes and Other Backward Classes from the State as notified by
the State Government; and

(b) the remaining seats shall be general category seats. Out of the
general category seats upto fifteen percent may be filled by candidates
belonging to the Non-Resident Indian quota:

Provided that where the seats reserved for the Scheduled Castes,
Scheduled Tribes and Other Backward Classes in an unaided non minority
institution are left unfilled due to non-availability of the candidates, or
where students of reserved categories leave after they select the seats, the
same shall be filled by the candidates belonging to the same category out of
the merit list of the Common Entrance Test conducted by the State Common
Entrance Test Committee:

Provided further that if seats are remain unfilled even thereafter, such
unfilled seats shall be filled from the student belonging to general merit on
the basis of merit through the Common Entrance Test conducted by the
association of Unaided Private Professional Educational Institutions.

(iii) (a) In an unaided minority professional educational institution, not
less than sixty six percent of the seats shall be filled by minority students



12

from within the State belonging to the minority community to which the
institution belongs on the basis of interse merit in the merit list of the
Common Entrance Test of the Association of Private Professional
educational institutions; and

(b) the remaining seats shall be the general category seats. Out of the
general category seats, upto fifteen percent may be filled by candidates
belonging to the Non Resident Indian quota:

Provided that if any seats earmarked for the minority category in
unaided institutions remain unfilled or where the students leave after
selection of seat the same shall be filled by minority students of the same
categories out of the merit list of the Common Entrance Test conducted by
the State Common Entrance Test Committee:

Provided further that if seats are remain unfilled even thereafter, such
unfilled seats shall be filled from the student belonging to general merit on
the basis of merit through the Common Entrance Test conducted by the
association of Unaided Private Professional Educational Institutions.

XX XX XX

(iv) Admission to all seats in a private unaided professional
educational institutions including reserved or general category seats but
excluding the seats which may be filled by Non-resident Indian candidates,
shall be made on the basis of merit by following the procedure of Common
Entrance test followed by centralized counseling conducted in the manner
as specified by the Admission Overseeing Committee.

XX XX XX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha Unit, Bengaluru 22nd March, 2017 P7, W.D.1168, Copies 1000





